NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS

p i BID TABULATION
«F s 2023-A-001 - ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MISCELLANEOUS AUTO PARTS
VENDOR : RATE Special item Rates

The best wholesale or
fleet price whichever is
B & G Auto Parts better

Corsicana Auto Parts LLC - NAPA |Wholesale or Better

Mills Auto Supply Dealer Price

O'Reilly Auto Parts List less 41% or better

FY2023 All Bids Awarded
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NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS
BID TABULATION
2023-C-002 - ANNUAL CONTRACT

S CULVERTS FOR COUNTY PRECINCTS
VENDOR; Wilson Culverts
DIAMETER (Inches) Gauge
CULVERTS (price per linear foot)
12 16 $ 14.31 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
15 16 $ 17.79 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
18 16 $ 21.32 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
24 16 $ 28.41 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
30 16 $ 35.59 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
36 16 $ 43.05 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
42 16 $ 49.77 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
48 14 $ 81.63 | 3" x 1" Corrugation
60 14 $ 100.57 | 3" x 1" Corrugation
72 14 $ 121.57 | 3" x 1" Corrugation
96 14 $ 160.31 | 3" x 1" Corrugation
DELIVERY 10 Working Days
DMP BANDS (price each)
12" $ 21.46
15" $ 26.69
18" $ 31.98
24" $ 42.62
30" $ 53.38
36" $ 64.58
42" $ 74.66
48" $ 85.32 | Wide Band
2 PC END SECTIONS 6:1 SLOPE WITH CHANNEL AND ANGLE
12" 2-12" 1% 202.00 | Pair w/bands
15" 2-15"19% 310.86 | Pair w/bands
18" 2-18" | § 441.16 | Pair w/bands
24" 2-24"1% 675.64 | Pair w/bands
30" 2-30"1% 966.12 | Pair w/bands
36" 2-36"| 9% 1,334.56 | Pair w/bands
DELIVERY 10 Working Days
CONTACT NAME Greg Barnett Manager
CONTACT PHONE 800-234-0084 wilsonculverts@hotmail.com

Contracted to: Wilson Culverts

2023 BID TABS
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NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS
BID TABULATION
2023-C-002 - ANNUAL CONTRACT
CULVERTS FOR COUNTY PRECINCTS

VENDOR,; Steele Metal
DIAMETER (inches) | Gauge Supply, LLC
CULVERTS (price per linear foot)
12 16 $ 21.00 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
15 16 $ 26.00 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
18 16 $ 31.00 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
24 16 $ 41.00 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
30 16 $ 44.50 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
36 16 $ 54.00 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
42 16 $ 99.00 | 2.66" x 1/2" Corrugation
48 14 5" x 1" Corrugation
60 14 5" x 1" Corrugation
72 14 5" x 1" Corrugation
96 14 5" x 1" Corrugation
3-4 days - In Stock
DELIVERY 2-3 Weeks - Out of
Stock
DMP BANDS (price each)
12" $ 32.00
15" $ 42.00
18" $ 50.00
24" $ 65.00
30" $ 58.00
36"
42"
48"
2 PC END SECTIONS 6:1 SLOPE WITH CHANNEL AND ANGLE
12" 2-12" 1% 250.00 | Pair w/bands
15" 2-15"1$ 350.00 | Pair w/bands
18" 2-18"1 9% 450.00 | Pair w/bands
24" 2-24"1% 550.00 | Pair w/bands
30" 2-30" Pair w/bands
36" 2 -36" Pair w/bands
3-4 days - In Stock
DELIVERY 2-3 Weeks - Out of
Stock
CONTACT NAME Wendy Steele steelemetalsupply@outlook.com
CONTACT PHONE 903-519-3563 '

Contract awarded to:

2023 BID TABS




NAVARRO COUNTY, TEXAS
BID TABULATION
2023-F-004 - ANNUAL CONTRACT
FUEL FOR COUNTY VEHICLES

VERBOR Cole Distributing
UNLEADED
Grade 87 Octane 87 Octane 89 Octane

Rack Price 2.6680
Tax 0.2000
Freight

Profit 0.1000
Total Cost 2.9680

Primary Distributor

Flint Hills - Waco

DIESEL
Rack Price 3.3390
Tax 0.2000
Freight
Profit 0.1000
Total Cost 3.6390

Primary Distributor

Flint Hills - Waco

CONTACT NAME

Michelle Boyd

Account Manager

CONTACT PHONE

903-872-6621

michelle.boyd@coledistributing.net

Bid awarded to:

2023 BID TAB
FUEL




Precint 1 - Hwy 22 Corsicana

Plant

Rates

C & B Excavation &

Navarro Co Dirt

BM Logistics Paving Depot, LLC Havoc Transportation Joey B Watson Tommy Montgomery
Arnold Crushed Hauling Rate 15.57 - NO BID 13.57 17.40 14.50
Blum Material Rate - Flex Base A Grade 1 & 2 6.15 6.15 6.15 6.15 6.15 6.15
Total Cost 21.72 6.15 6.15 19.72 23.55 20.65
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate 20.00 - 16.73 18.00 19.00 65.00
Dallas Material Rate - Waste 13.00 13.00 13.00 13.00 13.00 13.00
Total Cost 33.00 13.00 29.73 31.00 32.00 78.00
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate 20.00 - 16.73 18.00 19.00 65.00
Dallas Material Rate - Crushed Concrete 12.00 12.00 12.00 12.00 12.00 12.00
Total Cost 32.00 12.00 28.73 30.00 31.00 77.00
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate 10.50 - 12.02 9.75 12.00 11.35
Honest Ridge - Groesbeck  Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & A/2/2 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50
Total Cost 19.00 8.50 20.52 18.25 20.50 19.85
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate 15.50 - NO BID 13.50 17.30 14.50
Greenwade - Whitney Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & A/2/2 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50
Total Cost 24.00 8.50 8.50 22.00 25.80 23.00

Havoc Transportation Hauling Rate 11.00 - - - - -
Corsicana, TX Material Rate - Flex Base A/2/2 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00
Total Cost 25.00 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00
Helmcamp Materials Hauling Rate 10.50 - 12.54 9.25 12.00 11.35
Groesbeck Material Rate - 2" Base Grade 182 & 247 A1 Grade 1&2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total Cost 10.50 - 12.54 9.25 12.00 11.35
Knife River Corp - South Hauling Rate 25.00 - NO BID 25.00 25.00 35.00
Waco Material Rate - D-Mix 64-22 Oil 89.00 89.00 89.00 89.00 89.00 89.00
Total Cost 114.00 89.00 89.00 114.00 114.00 124.00
Knife River Corp - South Hauling Rate 10.50 - 10.98 9.75 12.00 11.35
Groesbeck, TX Material Rate - Waste, Clean crushed Limestone C Rock & D Rock 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00
Total Cost 45.50 20.25 45.98 4475 47.00 46.35
Knife River Corp - South Hauling Rate 10.50 - 10.98 9.75 12.00 11.35
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & Flex Base A/2/2 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00
: Total Cost 20.50 20.25 20.98 19.75 22.00 21.35




Lone Star Aggregates
Richland, TX

Lone Star Aggregates
Richland, TX

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Rattler Rock, Inc
Blum

Rattler Rock, Inc
Blum

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Hauling
Material Rate - Flex Base A/2/2

Hauling
Material Rate - Dirty Rock (Spoils)

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - State Base A/1/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate -Non Spec Base 5/8" A/2/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Type "D" Limestone & 3/8" Limestone
Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - #57 Limestone Rock
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Granite Flex Base
Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - 3" - 5" Screened Rock
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Hot Oil Sand
Total Cost

7.00 - NO BID 8.00 6.00 8.75
11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50
18.50 11.50 11.50 19.50 17.50 20.25

7.00 - NO BID 8.00 6.00 8.75

6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00
13.00 6.00 6.00 14.00 12.00 14.75

6.10 - 7.58 6.50 7.50 8.75
28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50
34.60 20.25 36.08 35.00 36.00 37.25

6.10 - 7.58 6.50 7.50 8.75
28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50
34.60 20.25 36.08 35.00 36.00 37.25

6.10 - 7.58 6.50 7.50 8.75
35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00
41.10 35.00 42.58 41.50 42.50 43.75

6.10 - 7.58 6.50 7.50 8.75
35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00
41.10 35.00 42.58 41.50 42.50 43.75

6.10 - 7.58 6.50 7.50 8.75
28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50
34.60 28.50 36.08 35.00 36.00 37.25
15.00 - NO BID 13.57 17.50 14.50

8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
23.00 8.00 8.00 21.57 2550 22.50
15.00 - NO BID 13.57 17.50 14.50

9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00
24.00 9.00 9.00 22.57 26.50 23.50
12.00 - NO BID 10.90 14.00 25.00
85.00 85.00 85.00 85.00 85.00 85.00
97.00 85.00 85.00 95.90 99.00 110.00




Texas Bit
Malakoff

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Waller County Asphalt
Hempstead, TX

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Hot Mix
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Mix
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Laid 334

12.00 - NO BID 10.90 14.00 25.00
98.00 98.00 98.00 98.00 98.00 98.00
110.00 98.00 98.00 108.90 112.00 123.00
12.00 - NO BID 10.90 14.00 25.00
100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00
112.00 100.00 100.00 110.90 114.00 125.00
60.00 - NO BID 60.00 60.00 NO BID
95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00
155.00 95.00 95.00 155.00 155.00 95.00
Ben Melton Bonnie Lee Robert Bergey | Jason Drain Joey Watson Tommy
903-875-9228 903-875-6163 903-437-2067 | 903-257-5365 254-205-2055 Montgomery

Number of
Trucks in Fleet
Unlimited
$125.00 HR
$85.00 HR PER
Tandum

.23 per loaded
ton per mile
Delivery Time:
Anytime
Min/Max Qty:
None
Limitations

on delivery
schedule: None

Number of
Trucks in
Fleet (3)

& Growing

Pct 1 $24.50/TN

Min Delivery Qty
23-24/per truck
Max Delivery Qty
25-26/per truck

Number of
Trucks in

Fleet (2) Have
access to
several more
Flat Rate Charge
Pct 1 - $160.00

Need 1 - 2 days
notice

Number of
Trucks in

Fleet (Unlimited)
Delivery Time:
Anytime

Min/Max

Delivery Qty:
None

Limitations on
Delivery Schedule
No Specifications

$125.00 per hr
$85.00 hr per tandum
.23 per loaded ton
per mile

Number of
Trucks in Fleet
(Unlimited)
Delivery Time:
Anytime
Min/Max
Delivery Qty:
None

$125.00 hr
$85.00 hr tandum
.23 per loaded
ton per mile

903-875-8194

Number of
Truck in Fleet
(Unlimited)
Delivery Time:
Open

Minimum
Delivery Qty: 13
Maximum
Delivery Qty: 25
Limitations on

Delivery Schedule:
None




Precinct 2 - Kerens

Plant

C & B Excavation &

Navarro Co Dirt

Rates BM Logistics Paving Depot, LLC Havoc Transportation Joey B Watson Tommy Montgomery
Arnold Crushed Hauling Rate 17.00 - NO BID 16.00 18.00 17.50
Blum Material Rate - Flex Base A Grade 1 & 2 6.15 6.15 6.15 6.15 6.15 6.15
Total Cost 23.15 6.15 6.15 22.15 24.15 23.65
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate - - 21.17 25.00 25.00 65.00
Dallas Material Rate - Waste 13.00 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00
Total Cost 13.00 9.00 30.17 34.00
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate - - 21.17 25.00 25.00 65.00
Dallas Material Rate - Crushed Concrete 12.00 9.50 9.50 9.50 9.50 9.50
Total Cost 12.00 9.50 30.67 34.50 34.50 74.50
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate 12.20 - 13.33 NO BID 13.50 12.25
Honest Ridge - Groesbeck  Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & A/2/2 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50
Total Cost 20.70 8.50 21.83 8.50 22.00 20.75
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate 16.50 - NO BID 15.50 14.50 17.50
Greenwade - Whitney Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & A/2/2 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50
Total Cost 25.00 8.50 8.50 24.00 23.00 26.00
Havoc Transportation Hauling Rate 11.00 - - - - -
Corsicana, TX Material Rate - Flex Base A/2/2 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00
Total Cost 25.00 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00
Knife River Corp - South Hauling Rate 23.00 - NO BID 28.00 28.00 35.00
Waco Material Rate - D-Mix 64-22 Qil 89.00 89.00 89.00 89.00 89.00 89.00
Total Cost 112.00 89.00 89.00 117.00 117.00 124.00
Knife River Corp - South Hauling Rate 13.00 - 13.07 14.00 13.50 12.25
Groesbeck, TX Material Rate - Waste, Clean crushed Limestone C Rock & D Rock 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00
Total Cost 48.00 20.25 48.07 49.00 48.50 47.25
Knife River Corp - South Hauling Rate 13.00 - 13.07 14.00 13.50 12.25
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & Flex Base A/2/2 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00
Total Cost 23.00 20.25 23.07 24.00 23.50 22.25
Lone Star Aggregates Hauling 8.90 - NO BID 9.00 9.50 9.75
Richland, TX Material Rate - Flex Base A/2/2 11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50
- 20.40 11.50 11.50 20.50 21.00 21.25




Lone Star Aggregates
Richland, TX

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Rattler Rock, Inc
Blum

Rattler Rock, Inc
Blum

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Hauling
Material Rate - Dirty Rock (Spoils)

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - State Base A/1/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate -Non Spec Base 5/8" A/2/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Type "D" Limestone & 3/8" Limestone
Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - #57 Limestone Rock
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Granite Flex Base
Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - 3" - 5" Screened Rock
Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Oil Sand
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Hot Mix
Total Cost

8.90

- NO BID 9.00 9.50 9.75

6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00
14.90 6.00 6.00 15.00 15.50 16.75
6.60 - 7.32 6.00 6.50 9.75
28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50
35.10 28.50 35.82 34.50 35.00 38.25
6.60 - 7.32 6.00 6.50 9.75
28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50
35.10 20.25 35.82 34.50 35.00 38.25
6.60 - 7.32 6.00 6.50 9.75
35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00
41.60 35.00 42.32 41.00 41.50 4475
6.60 - 7.32 6.00 6.50 9.75
35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00
41.60 35.00 42.32 41.00 41.50 44.75
6.60 - 7.32 6.00 6.50 9.75
28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50
35.10 28.50 35.82 34.50 35.00 38.25
16.00 - NO BID 16.50 15.00 17.50
8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
24.00 8.00 8.00 24.50 23.00 25.50
16.00 - NO BID 16.50 15.00 17.50
9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00
25.00 9.00 9.00 25.50 24.00 26.50
11.00 - NO BID 10.00 12.00 22.00
85.00 85.00 85.00 85.00 85.00 85.00
96.00 85.00 85.00 95.00 97.00 107.00
11.00 - NO BID 10.00 12.00 22.00
98.00 98.00 98.00 98.00 98.00 98.00
109.00 98.00 98.00 108.00 110.00 120.00




Texas Bit
Malakoff

Waller County Asphalt

Hempstead, TX

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Mix

Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Laid 334

11.00 - NO BID 10.00 12.00 22.00
100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00
111.00 100.00 100.00 110.00 112.00 122.00
NO BID - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00
95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00
Ben Melton Bonnie Lee Robert Bergey | Jason Drain Joey Watson Tommy
903-875-9228 903-875-6163 903-437-2067 | 903-257-5365 254-205-2055 Montgomery

Number of
Trucks in Fleet
Unlimited
$125.00 HR
$85.00 HR PER
Tandum

.23 per loaded
ton per mile
Delivery Time:
Anytime
Min/Max Qty:
None
Limitations

on delivery
schedule: None

Number of
Trucks in
Fleet (3)

& Growing

Pct 2 $25.50/TN

Min Delivery Qty
23-24/per truck
Max Delivery Qty
25-26/per truck

Number of
Trucks in

Fleet (2) Have
access to
several more
Flat Rate Charge
Pct 1-$160.00

Need 1 - 2 days
notice

Number of
Trucks in

Fleet (Unlimited)
Delivery Time:
Anytime
Min/Max
Delivery Qty:
None
Limitations on

Delivery Schedule
No Specifications

$125.00 per hr
$85.00 hr per tandum
.23 per loaded ton
per mile

Number of
Trucks in Fleet
(Unlimited)
Delivery Time:
Anytime
Min/Max
Delivery Qty:

None

$125.00 hr
$85.00 hr tandum
.23 per loaded
ton per mile

903-875-8194

Number of
Truck in Fleet
(Unlimited)
Delivery Time:
Open

Minimum
Delivery Qty: 13
Maximum
Delivery Qty: 25
Limitations on

Delivery Schedule:
None




Precinct 3 - Richland

C & B Excavation &

Navarro Co Dirt

Plant Rates BM Logistics Paving Depot, LLC Havoc Transportation Joey B Watson Tommy Montgomery
Arnold Crushed Hauling Rate NO BID - NO BID NO BID 17.00 17.50
Blum Material Rate - Flex Base A Grade 1 & 2 6.15 6.15 6.15 6.15 6.15 6.15
Total Cost 6.15 6.15 6.15 6.15 23.15 23.65
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate NO BID - 19.86 NO BID NO BID 67.00
Dallas Material Rate - Waste 13.00 13.00 13.00 13.00 13.00 13.00
Total Cost 13.00 13.00 32.86 13.00 13.00 80.00
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate NO BID - 19.86 NO BID NO BID 67.00
Dallas Material Rate - Crushed Concrete 12.00 12.00 12.00 12.00 12.00 12.00
Total Cost 12.00 12.00 31.86 12.00 12.00 79.00
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate NO BID - 10.98 NO BID 10.35 10.00
Honest Ridge - Groesbeck  Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & A/2/2 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50
Total Cost 8.50 8.50 19.48 8.50 18.85 18.50
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate NO BID - NO BID NO BID 20.00 17.50
Greenwade - Whitney Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & A/2/2 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50
Total Cost 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 28.50 26.00
Havoc Transportation Hauling Rate NO BID - - NO BiD - -
Corsicana, TX Material Rate - Flex Base A/2/2 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00
Total Cost 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00
Knife River Hauling Rate NO BID - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Bryan, TX Material Rate - - - - - -
Total Cost - - R = - -
Knife River Corp - South Hauling Rate NO BID - NO BID NO BID NO BID 35.00
Waco Material Rate - D-Mix 64-22 Oil 89.00 89.00 89.00 89.00 89.00 89.00
Total Cost 89.00 89.00 89.00 89.00 89.00 124.00
Knife River Corp - South Hauling Rate NO BID - 10.45 NO BID 10.35 10.00
Groesbeck, TX Material Rate - Waste, Clean crushed Limestone C Rock & D Rock 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00
Total Cost 35.00 20.25 45.45 35.00 45.35 45.00
Knife River Corp - South Hauling Rate NO BID - 10.45 NO BID 10.35 10.00
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & Flex Base A/2/2 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00
Total Cost 10.00 20.25 20.45 10.00 20.35 20.00




Lone Star Aggregates
Richland, TX

Lone Star Aggregates
Richland, TX

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Rattler Rock, Inc
Blum

Rattler Rock, Inc
Blum

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Hauling
Material Rate - Flex Base A/2/2

Hauling
Material Rate - Dirty Rock (Spoils)

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - State Base A/1/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate -Non Spec Base 5/8" A/2/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Type "D" Limestone & 3/8" Limestone
Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - #57 Limestone Rock
Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Granite Flex Base
Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - 3" - 5" Screened Rock
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Hot Oil Sand
Total Cost

NO BID - NO BID NO BID 6.00 8.50
11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50
11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50 17.50 20.00

NO BID - NO BID NO BID 6.00 8.50

6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00
6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 12.00 14.50

NO BID - 6.53 NO BID 9.00 8.50
28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50
28.50 28.50 35.03 28.50 37.50 37.00

NO BID - 6.53 NO BID 9.00 8.50
28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50
28.50 20.25 35.03 28.50 37.50 37.00

NO BID - 6.53 NO BID 9.00 8.50
35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00
35.00 35.00 41.53 35.00 44.00 43.50

NO BID - 6.53 NO BID 9.00 8.50
35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00
35.00 35.00 41.53 35.00 44.00 43.50

NO BID - 6.53 NO BID 9.00 8.50
28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50
28.50 28.50 35.03 28.50 37.50 37.00

NO BID - NO BID NO BID 16.50 17.50

8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 24.50 25.50
NO BID - NO BID NO BID 16.50 17.50
9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00
9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00 25.50 26.50

NO BID - NO BID NO BID NO BID 25.00
85.00 85.00 85.00 85.00 85.00 85.00
85.00 85.00 85.00 85.00 85.00 110.00




Texas Bit
Malakoff

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Waller County Asphailt
Hempstead, TX

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Hot Mix
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Mix
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Laid 334

NO BID - NO BID NO BID NO BID 25.00
98.00 98.00 98.00 98.00 98.00 98.00
98.00 98.00 98.00 98.00 98.00 123.00
NO BID - NO BID NO BID NO BID 25.00
100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00
100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 125.00
NO BID - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00
95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00
Ben Melton Bonnie Lee Robert Bergey | Jason Drain Joey Watson Tommy
903-875-9228 903-875-6163 903-437-2067 | 903-257-5365 254-205-2055 Montgomery

Number of
Trucks in Fleet
Unlimited
$125.00 HR
$85.00 HR PER
Tandum

.23 per loaded
ton per mile
Delivery Time:
Anytime
Min/Max Qty:
None
Limitations

on delivery
schedule: None

Number of
Trucks in
Fleet (3)

& Growing

Pct 3 $25.50/TN

Min Delivery Qty
23-24/per truck
Max Delivery Qty
25-26/per truck

Number of
Trucks in

Fleet (2) Have
access to
several more
Flat Rate Charge
Pct 1 - $160.00

Need 1 - 2 days
notice

Number of
Trucks in

Fleet (Unlimited)
Delivery Time:
Anytime

Min/Max

Delivery Qty:
None
Limitations on
Delivery Schedule
No Specifications

$125.00 per hr
$85.00 hr per tandum
.23 per loaded ton
per mile

Number of
Trucks in Fleet
(Unlimited)
Delivery Time:
Anytime
Min/Max
Delivery Qty:
None

$125.00 hr
$85.00 hr tandum
.23 per loaded
ton per mile

903-875-8194

Number of
Truck in Fleet
(Unlimited)
Delivery Time:
Open

Minimum
Delivery Qty: 13
Maximum
Delivery Qty: 25
Limitations on

Delivery Schedule:
None




Precinct 3 - Dawson

C & B Excavation & Navarro Co Dirt

Plant Rates BM Logistics Paving Depot, LLC Havoc Transportation Joey B Watson Tommy Montgomery
Arnold Crushed Hauling Rate NO BID - NO BID NO BID 12.50 12.80
Blum Material Rate - Flex Base A Grade 1 & 2 6.15 6.15 6.15 6.15 6.15 6.15
Total Cost 6.15 6.15 6.15 6.15 18.65 18.95
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate NO BID - 24.83 NO BID NO BID 65.00
Dallas Material Rate - Waste 13.00 13.00 13.00 13.00 13.00 13.00
Total Cost 13.00 13.00 37.83 13.00 13.00 78.00
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate NO BID - 24.83 NO BID NO BID 65.00
Dallas Material Rate - Crushed Concrete 12.00 12.00 12.00 12.00 12.00 12.00
Total Cost 12.00 12.00 36.83 12.00 12.00 77.00
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate NO BID - 11.76 NO BID 10.50 10.50
Honest Ridge - Groesbeck  Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & A/2/2 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50
Total Cost 8.50 8.50 20.26 8.50 19.00 19.00
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate NO BID - NO BID NO BID 11.75 14.50
Greenwade - Whitney Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & A/2/2 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50
Total Cost 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 20.25 23.00

Havoc Transportation Hauling Rate NO BID - - NO BID - -
Corsicana, TX Material Rate - Flex Base A/2/2 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00
Total Cost 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00
Knife River Corp - South Hauling Rate NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 25.00
Waco Material Rate - D-Mix 64-22 Qil Asphalt 89.00 89.00 89.00 89.00 89.00 89.00
Total Cost 89.00 89.00 89.00 89.00 89.00 114.00
Knife River Corp - South Hauling Rate NO BID - 12.28 NO BID 10.50 10.50
Groesbeck, TX Material Rate - Waste, Clean crushed Limestone C Rock & D Rock 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00
Total Cost 35.00 20.25 47.28 35.00 45.50 45.50
Knife River Corp - South Hauling Rate NO BID - 12.28 NO BID 10.50 10.50
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & Flex Base A/2/2 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00
Total Cost 10.00 20.25 22.28 10.00 20.50 20.50
Lone Star Aggregates Hauling NO BID - NO BID NO BID 12.00 8.50
Richland, TX Material Rate - Fiex Base A/2/2 11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50
P 11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50 23.50 20.00




Lone Star Aggregates
Richland, TX

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Rattler Rock, Inc
Blum

Rattler Rock, Inc
Blum

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Hauling
Material Rate - Dirty Rock (Spoils)

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - State Base A/1/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate -Non Spec Base 5/8" Aj2/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Type "D" Limestone & 3/8" Limestone
Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - #57 Limestone Rock
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Granite Flex Base
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - 3" - 5" Screened Rock
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Hot Qil Sand
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Hot Mix
Total Cost

NO BID - NO BID NO BID 12.00 8.50
6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00
6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 18.00 14.50

NO BID - 8.36 NO BID 10.50 8.50

28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50
28.50 28.50 36.86 28.50 39.00 37.00
NO BID - 8.36 NO BID 10.50 8.50
28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50
28.50 20.25 36.86 28.50 39.00 37.00
NO BID - 8.36 NO BID 10.50 8.50
35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00
35.00 35.00 43.36 35.00 45.50 43.50
NO BID - 8.36 NO BID 10.50 8.50
35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00
35.00 35.00 43.36 35.00 45.50 43.50
NO BID - 8.36 NO BID 10.50 8.50
28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50
28.50 28.50 36.86 28.50 39.00 37.00

NO BID - NO BID NO BID 11.00 12.80
8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 19.00 20.80

NO BID - NO BID NO BID 11.00 12.80
9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00
9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00 20.00 21.80

NO BID - NO BID NO BID NO BID 25.00

85.00 85.00 85.00 85.00 85.00 85.00
85.00 85.00 85.00 85.00 85.00 110.00
NO BID - NO BID NO BID NO BID 25.00
98.00 98.00 98.00 98.00 98.00 98.00
98.00 98.00 98.00 98.00 98.00 123.00




Texas Bit
Malakoff

Waller County Asphait

Hempstead, TX

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Mix

Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Laid 334

NO BID - NO BID NO BID NO BID 25.00
100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00
100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 125.00
NO BID - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00
95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00
Ben Meiton Bonnie Lee Robert Bergey | Jason Drain Joey Watson Tommy
903-875-9228 903-875-6163 903-437-2067 | 903-257-5365 254-205-2055 Montgomery

Number of
Trucks in Fleet
Unlimited
$125.00 HR
$85.00 HR PER
Tandum

.23 per loaded
ton per mile
Delivery Time:
Anytime
Min/Max Qty:
None

Limitations
on delivery
schedule: None

Number of
Trucks in
Fleet (3)

& Growing

Pct 3 $24.50/TN

Min Delivery Qty
23-24/per truck
Max Delivery Qty
25-26/per truck

Number of
Trucks in

Fleet (2) Have
access to
several more
Flat Rate Charge
Pct 1 - $160.00

Need 1 - 2 days

notice

Number of
Trucks in

Fleet (Unlimited)
Delivery Time:
Anytime

Min/Max

Delivery Qty:
None

Limitations on
Delivery Schedule

No Specifications

$125.00 per hr
$85.00 hr per tandum
.23 per loaded ton
per mile

Number of
Trucks in Fleet
(Unlimited)
Delivery Time:
Anytime
Min/Max
Delivery Qty:

None

$125.00 hr
$85.00 hr tandum
.23 per loaded

ton per mile

903-875-8194

Number of
Truck in Fleet
(Unlimited)
Delivery Time:
Open

Minimum
Delivery Qty: 13
Maximum
Delivery Qty: 25
Limitations on
Delivery Schedule:

None




Precinct 4 - Blooming Grove

C & B Excavation & Navarro Co Dirt

Plant Rates BM Logistics Paving Depot, LLC Havoc Transportation Joey B Watson Tommy Montgomery
Arnold Crushed Hauling Rate 10.50 - NO BID 10.99 12.00 12.50
Blum Material Rate - Flex Base A Grade 1 & 2 6.15 6.15 6.15 6.15 6.15 6.15
Total Cost 16.65 6.15 6.15 17.14 18.15 18.65
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate NO BID - 21.17 NO BID NO BID 65.00
Dallas Material Rate - Waste 13.00 13.00 13.00 13.00 13.00 13.00
Total Cost 13.00 13.00 34.17 13.00 13.00 78.00
Big City Crushed Stone Hauling Rate NO BID - 21.17 NO BID NO BID 65.00
Dallas Material Rate - Crushed Concrete 12.00 12.00 12.00 12.00 12.00 12.00
Total Cost 12.00 12.00 33.17 12.00 12.00 77.00
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate 10.50 - 16.99 11.00 10.00 12.50
Honest Ridge - Groesbeck  Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & A/2/2 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50
Total Cost 19.00 8.50 25.49 19.50 18.50 21.00
Conners Construction Co Hauling Rate 10.50 - NO BID 10.99 12.00 14.50
Greenwade - Whitney Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & A/2/2 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50 8.50
Total Cost 19.00 8.50 8.50 19.49 20.50 23.00

Havoc Transportation Hauling Rate - - - - - -
Corsicana, TX Material Rate - Flex Base A/2/2 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00
Total Cost 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00 14.00
Knife River Corp - South Hauling Rate NO BID - NO BID NO BID NO BiD 25.00
Waco Material Rate - D-Mix 64-22 Qil Asphalt 89.00 89.00 89.00 89.00 89.00 89.00
Total Cost 89.00 89.00 89.00 89.00 89.00 114.00
Knife River Corp - South Hauling Rate NO BID - 12.54 11.00 10.00 12.50
Waco Material Rate - Waste, Clean crushed Limestone C Rock & D Rock 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00
Total Cost 35.00 20.25 47.54 46.00 45.00 47.50
Knife River Corp - South Hauling Rate 10.50 - 12.54 11.00 10.00 12,50
Groesbeck Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2 & Flex Base A/2/2 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00
Total Cost 20.50 20.25 22.54 21.00 20.00 22.50
Lone Star Aggregates Hauling 12.50 - NO BID 10.50 11.50 8.50
Richland, TX Material Rate - Flex Base A/2/2 11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50 11.50
. 24,00 11.50 11.50 22.00 23.00 20.00




Lone Star Aggregates
Richland, TX

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Martin Marietta
Corsicana Rail

Rattler Rock, Inc
Blum

Rattler Rock, Inc
Blum

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Texas Bit
Malakoff

Hauling
Material Rate - Dirty Rock (Spoils)

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - State Base A/1/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate -Non Spec Base 5/8" A/2/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Type "D" Limestone & 3/8" Limestone
Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - #57 Limestone Rock
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Granite Flex Base
Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Flex Base A/1/2
Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - 3" - 5" Screened Rock Type C
Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Oil Sand
Total Cost

Hauling Rate
Material Rate - Hot Mix
Total Cost

12.50 B NO BID 10.50 11.50 8.50
6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00 6.00
18.50 6.00 6.00 16.50 17.50 14.50
9.00 - 6.79 10.00 8.00 8.50
28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50
37.50 28.50 35.29 38.50 36.50 37.00
9.00 - 6.79 10.00 8.00 8.50
28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50
37.50 20.25 35.29 38.50 36.50 37.00
9.00 - 6.79 10.00 8.00 8.50
35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00
44.00 35.00 41.79 45.00 43.00 43.50
9.00 - 6.79 10.00 8.00 8.50
35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00
44.00 35.00 41.79 45.00 43.00 43.50
9.00 - 6.79 10.00 8.00 8.50
28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50 28.50
37.50 28.50 35.29 38.50 36.50 37.00
10.50 - NO BID 10.99 12.00 12.50
8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00 8.00
18.50 8.00 8.00 18.99 20.00 20.50
10.50 - NO BID 10.99 12.00 12.50
9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00 9.00
19.50 9.00 9.00 19.99 21.00 21.50
15.00 - NO BID 14.00 16.00 25.00
85.00 85.00 85.00 85.00 85.00 85.00
100.00 85.00 85.00 99.00 101.00 110.00
15.00 - NO BID 14.00 16.00 25.00
98.00 98.00 98.00 98.00 98.00 98.00
113.00 98.00 98.00 112.00 114.00 123.00




Texas Bit
Malakoff

Waller County Asphalt

Hempstead, TX

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Mix

Total Cost

Hauling Rate

Material Rate - Hot Mix Cold Laid 334

15.00 - NO BID 14.00 16.00 25.00
100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00
115.00 100.00 100.00 114.00 116.00 125.00
NO BID - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00
95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00 95.00
Ben Melton Bonnie Lee Robert Bergey | Jason Drain Joey Watson Tommy
903-875-9228 903-875-6163 903-437-2067 | 903-257-5365 254-205-2055 Montgomery
903-875-8194
Number of Number of Number of Number of Number of Number of
Trucks in Fleet Trucks in Trucks in Trucks in Trucks in Fleet Truck in Fleet
Unlimited Fleet (3) Fleet (2) Have Fleet (Unlimited) {Unlimited) (Unlimited)
$125.00 HR & Growing access to Delivery Time: Delivery Time: Delivery Time:
$85.00 HR PER several more Anytime Anytime Open
Tandum Pct 4 $24 50/TN Flat Rate Charge Min/Max Min/Max Minimum
.23 per loaded Pct 1 - $160.00 Delivery Qty: Delivery Qty: Delivery Qty: 13
ton per mile Min Delivery Qty None None Maximum
Delivery Time: 23-24/per truck Need 1 - 2 days Limitations on Delivery Qty: 25
Anytime Max Delivery Qty notice Delivery Schedule $125.00 hr Limitations on
Min/Max Qty: 25-26/per truck No Specifications $85.00 hr tandum Delivery Schedule:
None .23 per loaded None
Limitations $125.00 per hr ton per mile
on delivery $85.00 hr per tandum

schedule: None

.23 per loaded ton
per mile




NONTESTE O.q.I.mw
HOT MIX FLEX | FLEX TYPE | TYPE DD/F 38 (See
{Material picked up at pit/plant) HOT OIL GOLD CATIONIC { BASE | BASE "c" "D" |BLEND 3/8 - |NONTESTED| PEA Dirty _.G.—.;im.mc_.: .zcn.m...m.
VENDOR LOCATION SAND |HOTMIX| LAID | EMULSION | A/Mi2 | Al2/2 [WASTE| ROCK | ROCK | 1/2 GRAVEL| FLEX BASE|GRAVEL| Rock Aggregate | Below)
Arnold Crushed Stone Blum, TX $6.15 |
Big City Crushed Concrete Dallas, TX 13.00 Ll
C & B Excavation & Paving Austin, Blum, Frost m
Conners Crushed Stone Groesbeck, TX & Whitney, TX 8.50 | 8.50 v
| Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc_| Temple, TX 702.10 v
Havoc Transportation Corsicana, TX 14.00
Knife River Corp - South Waco, Groesbeck, Bryan 89.00 10.00 | 10.00 | 35.00 | 35.00 [ 35.00 Vi
Lone Star Aggregates Richland, TX 11.50 6.00 vil
Martin Marietta Corsicana 28.50 | 28.50 35.00 Vil
Rattler Rock, Inc Blum, TX 8.00 9.00 IX
Texas Bit Malakoff, TX 85.00 98.00 | 100.00
Waller County Asphalt, Inc Hempstead, TX 95.00 X
P2 Emulsions Xl
NO BID SUBMITTED FOR FY2023
| Big Creek Construction Hewitt, TX & Corsicana, TX | NOBID [ NO BID | NO BID
Cleveland Asphalt Products, Inc | Shepherd, 'TX NO BID
Helmcamp Materials, Ltd Groesbeck, TX NO BID
Mine Service, Inc Waco, TX NO BID NOBID | NOBID NO BID
Sustainable Pavement Tech Dallas,TX NO BID




(Material delivered) - PCT 1

Arnold Crushed Stone

Blum, TX

Big City Crushed Concrete

Dallas, TX

33.00

C & B Excavation & Paving Austin, Blum, Frost 24.50 | 24.50 50.00 34.00 | 24.00 5000 |

Conners Crushed Stone Groesbeck, TX & Whitney, TX v
| Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc | Temple, TX 747.10 v

Havoc Transportation Corsicana, TX 25.00

Knife River Corp - South Waco, Groesbeck, Bryan Vi

Lone Star Aggregates Richland, TX Vil

Martin Marietta Corsicana vil

Rattler Rock, Inc Blum, TX IX

Texas Bit Malakoff, TX 100.00 | 113.00 | 115.00

Waller County Asphalt, Inc Hempstead, TX 156.25 X

P2 Emulsions

Xi




(Material delivered) PCT 2

Arnold Crushed Stone

Blum, TX

Big City Crushed Concrete

Dallas, TX

34.50

C & B Excavation & Paving Austin, Blum, Frost 25.50 | 25.50 51.00 35.00 | 25.00 51.00 i

Conners Crushed Stone Groesbeck, TX & Whitney, TX v
| Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc_| Temple, TX 747.10 v

Havoc Transportation Corsicana, TX 25.00

Knife River Corp - South Waco, Groesbeck, Bryan Vi

Lone Star Aggregates Richland, TX Vil

Martin Marietta Corsicana Ml

Rattler Rock, Inc Blum, TX IX

Texas Bit Malakoff, TX 100.00 | 113.00 | 115.00

Waller County Asphalt, Inc Hempstead, TX 151.70 X

P2 Emulsions

Xl




HOT MIX FLEX | FLEX TYPE | TYPE | GRADE 3 38
HOT OIL COLD CATIONIC | BASE | BASE vc" “p* COVER PEA Umnx : Lightweight
{Material delivered) PCT3 SAND | HOTMIX| LAID | EMULSION| A/M/2 | AlRI2 | WASTE| ROCK | ROCK STONE GRAVEL| Rock | Aggregate | OTHER

Arnold Crushed Stone Blum, TX |

Big City Crushed Concrete Dallas, TX 34.50 Ul

C & B Excavation & Paving Austin, Blum, Frost 25.50 | 25.50 51.00 35.00 ] 25.00 51.00 in

Conners Crushed Stone Groesbeck, TX & Whitney, TX v
| Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions Temple, TX 747.10 v

Havoc Transportation Corsicana, TX 25.00

Knife River Corp - South Waco, Groesbeck, Bryan vi

Lone Star Aggregates Richland, TX vii

Martin Marietta Corsicana viil

Rattler Rock, Inc Elm Mott, TX IX

Texas Bit Malakoff, TX 100.00 | 113.00 | 115.00

Waller County Asphait, Inc Hempstead, TX 150.30 X

P2 Emulsions Elm Mott, TX Xi




(Material delivered) PCT 4

Arnold Crushed Stone

Blum, TX

Big City Crushed Concrete

Dallas, TX

33.00

C & B Excavation & Paving Austin, Blum, Frost 24.50 | 24.50 50.00 34.00 [ 24.00 50.00 1]

Conners Crushed Stone Groesbeck, TX & Whitney, TX v

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions Temple, TX 747.10 A

Havoc Transportation Corsicana, TX 25.00

Knife River Corp - South Waco, Groesbeck, Bryan Vi

Lone Star Aggregates Richland, TX vit
Martin Marietta Corsicana vini
Rattler Rock, Inc Blum, TX IX
Texas Bit Malakoff, TX 100.00 | 113.00 ] 115.00

Waller County Asphailt, Inc Hempstead, TX 158.35 X

P2 Emulsions Elm Mott, TX XI




Other Products offered are on last page.
Prices shown are per ton unless otherwise specified.

I. Arnold Crushed Stone, Inc
1676 HCR 1104 LP

PO Box 632

Blum, TX 76627

Mike Arnold - Owner

Erica Haffner - General Manager
254-998-4434
erica@arnoldcrushedstone.com

Torpedo Rock (3/8" - 3/4" screened) $10.50/ton
Fines (1/2" minus) $4.00/ton

#57 Rock (1/2" - 1 1/4" screened) $17.85/ton
Oversize (2" x 4" & 3" x 5") $11.55/ton

Gabion (4" x 8") $14.18/ton

Rip Rap (8" x 12") $24.15/ton

Rip Rap (12" x 18", 18" x 24", 24" x 36") $23.10/ton
Fines $4.73/ton

ll. Big City Crushed Concrete
11143 Goodnight Lane

PO Box 29816

Dallas, TX 75229

Josh Hylema, Manager
972-243-5820
josh@bccclp.com

Bidding Crushed Concrete flex base item 247 Flex Base
Type D Grade 1-2 - Delivered in Trailers

Flex Base crushed concrete picked up: $12.00/ton

Pct 1 $32.00 per ton delivered in trailer

Pct 2 $32.50 per ton delivered in trailer

Pct 3 $32.50 per ton delivered in trailer

Pct 4 $32.00 per ton delivered in trailer

lll. C & B Excavating & Paving
805 imperial Lane

Corsicana, TX 75110

Bonnie Lee, Owner
903-875-6163

candbexcavationandpaving@gmail.com

Asphalt - Type B Asphalt - Type C

Pct 1 - $99.00/Per Ton Pct 1 - $103.00/Per Ton
Pct 2 - $100.00/Per Ton Pct 2 - $104.00/Per Ton
Pct 3 - $100.00/Per Ton Pct 3 - $104.00/Per Ton
Pct 4 - $99/Per Ton Pct 4 - $103.00/Per Ton

Asphalt - Type D

Pct 1 -$105.00/Per Ton
Pct 2 - $106.00/Per Ton
Pct 3 - $106.00/Per Ton
Pct 4 - $105.00/Per Ton

IV. Conners Crushed Stone
2513 US Hwy 77

Lott, TX 76655

Hailey Sudduth, Sales
254-584-2011

haileySudduth@gmail.com

Material Only:

Standard Road Base - $7.75/Ton
3/4" Minus - $5.00/Ton

Crusher Fines - $4.00/Ton

Location: Honest Ridge Quarry - 862 CR 374 Groesbeck, TX
Location: Greenewade Quarry - 173 CR 1090 Clifton, TX &

11612 RM 2244, Bidg 1, Ste 250
Austin, TX 78738

Karen Sellers, Account Specialist
512-469-9292
karen.sellers@ergon.com

V. Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc

This Bid is for full transport loads of 5,500 Gallons. Freight is based on a full transport load, even if a full load of material is not
ordered. The common carrier bills demurrage @ $90.00 per hour, after the second hour. Return freight is one-half of the outgoing
tariff. Pump and hose charge is $90.00 per load. For Equipment ordered, but not used, carrier may charge up to $400.00




VI. Knife River Corp - South
6310 Hwy 21 West

Bryan, TX 77807

Johnnie Pickens, Sales Manager
254-709-0290
johnnie.pickens@kniferiver.com

1 x 3 Rip Rap - $20.00/ton

2 x 5 Rip Rap - $20.00/ton

6 x 12 Rip Rap - $38.00/ton

12 X 18 Rip Rap - $40.00/ton

18 x 24 Rip Rap - $44.00/ton

4 x 8 Rip Rap - $20.00/ton

Non Spec Crusher Fines $6.00 /ton

All Rip Rap located at 3812 West FM 1633 Groesbeck, TX

** All items on bid quoted FOB Sky High Quarry** (located at 3812 FM 1633 West, Groesbeck, TX)
** All Rip Rap items priced above FOB Sky High Quarry** 3812 FM 1633 West - Groesbeck, TX

Vil. Lone Star Aggregates

8865 CR 0030

Richland, TX 76681

Jimmy Roberts, Sales Manager
314-409-8748
johnnie.pickens@kniferiver.com

Rip Rap 1 x 3 - $22.00/ton
Rip Rap 3 x 5 - $25.00/ton
Rip Rap 4 x 8 - $25.00/ton
Rip Rap 8 12 - $35.00/ton
Rip Rap 12 x 18 - $40.00/ton
Spoils - $6.00/ton

VIll. Martin Marietta Inc
1503 LBJ Freeway, #400
Dallas, TX 75234

Zach Bean, Sales Representative
214-543-3597
zach.bean@martinmarietta.com

#57 Limestone Rock, $35.00 per ton picked up
Granite Flexbase, $28.50 per ton picked up

IX. Rattler Rock, Inc
PO Box 10

Blum, TX 76627
Charles L Davis il - President
254-874-5282

1" x 3" screened rock $9.00/ton
untested blue base $7.00/ton

Above items are sold when available

X. Waller County Asphait, Inc
22010 Fairgrounds Rd
Hempstead, TX 77445

Reid Dawson, Vice President
979-826-7075
info@wcasphalt.com
rtaylor@wcasphalt.com

COLD MIX ASPHALT - ASPPM 9202 Grade IV High Performance All Weather / All Seasons Cold Mix
Material Only - $105.00/ton

Delivered Pct 1 - $166.25
Delivered Pct 2 - $161.70
Delivered Pct 3 - $160.30
Delivered Pct 4 - $168.35




Xl. P2 Emulsions Product Tanker FOB Plant Tanker FOB County Drum/Tote Plant
516 South McLennan Loop P2 Stabilizer $2.68 $2.96 $2.90
Elm Mott, TX 76640 P2S1 $2.68 $2.96 $2.90
Seth McGinnis CEO & President George Tomek, Salesman (P2 CWE-2 $3.01 $3.29 $3.23
254-829-0330 254-230-3030 (Chip Seal)
office@p2emulsions.com P2 CWP. $3.01 $3.29 $3.23
(Cold Weather Patch)
P2 ROC $2.83 $3.10 $3.05
Road Over Coat
P2 Rejuvenator $2.68 $2.96 $2.90
P2 Prime Concentrate $1.97 $2.24 $2.19
P2RTU $1.93 $2.20 $2.15

** All listed prices are per U.S. Gallon
**Minimum Tanker Delivery: 5,000 Gallons
**Delivery over 250 miles subject to additional charges

**Demurrage (trucking charge): First 2 hours free, $80.00 per hour hereafter

**Pump Charge (trucking charge): $80.00
**Push Charge (trucking charge): $80.00 per hour

**Return Loads (trucking charge): Subject to charge from delivering freight line

**Smaller Quantities Available, Subject to Freight Differential of $0.25/gal less than 5,000 gal

P2 Emulsions description of products is attached to Road Bid Packet




